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 Product name Aloe Vera Frangipani Face Balm – 1.7 oz. 

 Moon phase Daily, /   waxing moon ~ full moon  

 How to use 1. After cleansing your skin, apply face balm to face, neck 
and décolleté and rub in gently.  

 Ingredients  
 

Aloe Vera Barbadensis (Aloe Vera) leafe juice***, 
Ammonium Acryloyldimethyltaurate/VP Copolymer, 
Parfum**, Benzylalcohol, Limonene*, *Linalool, *Citral, 
*Benzyl cinnamate, *Citronellol, *Benzyl benzoate, Citric 
Acid *allergenics in essential oils, **pure essentail oils, 
***organic cultivation 

 Ingredients & effect 
 
 
 

 

 

 
 
 
 
 
 

Aloe Vera Gel 

1. Aloe Vera: With its unique properties, this robust plant 
gives wrinkly and dry skin back its peachy and firm look and 
soothes irritated sensitive skin. It also accelerates the 
healing process of pimples and inflammation. 
 
2. Frangipani: probably one of the most beautiful and 
fragrant tropical flowers. It is also known as Plumeria or the 
Temple Tree. In the tropical regions, the unique beauty of its 
flower and its wonderful fragrance have come to make it a 
symbol for immortality that, as a temple flower, is offered to 
the gods in beautiful bowls. Pure frangipani oil is a real 
all-rounder: due to its detumescing, calming action, it can be 
used for all skin types, making your skin feel smooth and 
supple. Its ability to smooth out wrinkles makes it a real 
“beauty secret”. 

 Goes well with  All skin care products 
 Skin type All 

 Psychological action (fragrance) Moisturizing 

 Effects on skin 

This balm contains 98% of pure organic Aloe Vera Gel and 
can therefore be used as a pure moisturizing treatment as 
well as an add-on before applying your day or night cream. 
A must-have for times when your skin is extremely dry – in 
winter, after sunbathing, workout or sauna. 


