
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
 product name  Salt Bath “Rose Blossom” 
 moon phase    waning moon ~ new moon  

 how to use  

Dissolve 2 – 3 tbsps of the product in warm bath water 
(body temperature) and relax in the tub for 15 minutes. Do 
not shower afterwards. Wrap yourself in a pre-warmed 
bath robe and rest for 20 minutes to intensify the 
beneficial effect.  

 ingredients (INCI) 
Maris sal (dead sea salt), perfume**, Citronellol*, 
Linalool*, Geraniol*, **pure essential oils, *allergenics in 
essential oils, dried rose blossoms 

 main ingredients and product 
benefits  
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 

DEAD SEE  

 
Salt from the Dead Sea:  
 
thanks to the therapeutical and regenerating effect of 
highly concentrated minerals, healing and nurturing 
agents similar to the skin and the high quality sea salt this 
detoxifying salt bath can be can both calm sensitive skin 
and pamper body and senses. The Dead Sea is a 800 km² 
big salt lake whose surface and shores are 427 metres 
below sea level, Earth’s lowest elevation on land. The 
Dead Sea is 306 m (1,004 ft) deep, the deepest 
hypersaline lake in the world. With 34.2% salinity, it is also 
one of the world's saltiest bodies of water. The Dead Sea 
area has become a major center for health research and 
treatment for several reasons. The mineral content of the 
water, the very low content of pollens and other allergens 
in the atmosphere, the reduced ultraviolet component of 
solar radiation, and the higher atmospheric pressure at 
this great depth each have specific health effects. 

 goes well with  Aloe Vera Rose Body Oil   

 skin type  all, especially for cellulite, atopic dermatitis  

 psychological effect (scent)  flowery sweet  

 benefits for the skin  
This sea salt bath is particularly recommended for 
detoxifying cures since it activates the elimination of toxins 
and fat deposits and stimulates the metabolisam. 
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